Sign Bid Request for Leavenworth County
2024 Bid Tabulation

Custom Products Jackson, Centerline Supply  Grand Lightle Enterprises Osburn Associates Logan, Vulcan Inc. Foley, Welborn Sales National Sign Co.  Ottawa,
MS Praire, TX Frankfort, OH OH AL Salina, KS KS
Per Unit Total Per Unit Total Per Unit Total Per Unit Total Per Unit Total Per Unit Total Per Unit Total

High Intensity Prismatic reflective Faces P/S
W1-1R 30"x30" Turn Right Black/Yellow 8 S 13.08 |S 104.64 [S 22.50 |S 180.00 [S 15.00 |S 120.00 [S 12.38 (S 99.04 |S 1237 |S 98.96 |S 43.46 |S 347.68 |S 12.00 |S 96.00
W1-2R 30"x30" Curve right Black/Yellow 5 S 13.08 |S 65.40 [S 22.50 |S 112.50 [$ 15.00 |S 75.00 [S 12.38 |S 61.90 [S 12.37|S 61.85 (S 43.46 |S 21730 |S 12.00 |S 60.00
W1-2L 30"x30" Curve Left Black/Yellow 5 S 13.08 |S 65.40 [S 22.50 |S 112.50 (S 15.00 |S 75.00 |S 12.38|S 6190 [S 12.37|S 61.85 (S 43.46 |S 217.30 |S 12.00 |S 60.00
W1-5R 30"x30" Windy Road Right Black/Yellow 6 S 13.08 |S 78.48 S 22.50 |S 135.00 [$ 15.00 |S 90.00 |S 12.38 |S 7428 S 12.37 |S 7422 |S 43.46 |S 260.76 |S 12.00 |S 72.00
W1-6 Single Arrow 24"x48" black/yellow 4 S 16.74 |S 83.70 [S 28.71|S 114.84 S 19.20 (S 76.80 [S 15.84 |S 63.36 [S 15.84 |S 63.36 |S 55.60 |S 22240 |S 18.20 |S 72.80
W1-7 Double Arrow 24"x48" black/yellow 4 S 16.74 |S 83.70 [S 28.71|S 114.84 [S 19.20 |S 76.80 [S 15.84 |S 63.36 [S 15.84 |S 63.36 [S 55.60 | S 222.40 |S 18.20 |S 72.80
W1-8 Chevron 24"x30" black/yellow 20 $ 10.70 |S 214.00 |S 14.75|S 295.00 |S 12.00 |S 240.00 |S 9.90 | S 198.00 |$ 9.90 | S 198.00 [$ 34.75 (S 695.00 |S 12.00 |S 240.00
W1-8 Chevron 18"x24" black/yellow 10 S 6.46 S 64.60 [S 10.80 |S 108.00 | S 7.20 |S 72.00 |S 5.94 |$ 59.40 | S 5.94 [S 59.40 [S 20.85 |S 208.50 | S 7.00 | S 70.00
W1-10R Curve Right 36"x36" black/yellow S 18.69 |S 112.14 [$ 3250 (S 195.00 [$ 21.60 |S 129.60 [S 17.82 (S 106.92 (S 17.82 S 106.92 [$ 62.55 (S 37530 |S 16.00 |S 96.00
W2-1 Cross Road 30"x30" black/yellow 6 S 13.08 |S 78.48 |S 2250 |S 135.00 [$ 15.00 |S 90.00 |S 12.38|S 7428 S 12.37|S 7422 |S 43.46 |S 260.76 |S 12.00 |S 72.00
W2-7L Intersection Ahead 30"x30" black/yellow S 13.08 |S 78.48 S 22.50 |S 135.00 [$ 15.00 |S 90.00 |S 12.38 |S 7428 S 12.37 |S 7422 |S 43.46 |S 260.76 |S 12.00 |S 72.00
W3-1 Stop Ahead 30"x30" black/yellow/red 15 $ 2039 |S 305.85 |S 22.50 |S 337.50 |S 16.60 |$ 249.00 |S 12.38 |S 185.70 [$ 13.50 (S 202.50 |S 43.46 |S 651.90 |S 14.00 |S 210.00
W4-2L Merge Left 30"x30" black/yellow 4 S 13.08 |S 65.40 [S 22.50 |S 90.00 |S 15.00 |S 60.00 [S 12.38 |S 49.52 |S 12.37|S 49.48 |S 43.46 |S 173.84 [S 12.00 |S 48.00
W8-3 Pavement Ends 30"x30" black/yellow 12 $ 13.08 |S 156.96 [$ 22.50 (S 270.00 |S 15.00 |S 180.00 [S 12.38 (S 148.56 S 1237 (S 148.44 |S 43.46 (S 521.52 |S 12.00 |S 144.00
W11-8 Fire Station 30"x30" black/yellow S 13.08 |S 104.64 |S 2250 |S 180.00 |S 15.00 |S 120.00 |S 12.38 |S 99.04 |S 12.37|S 98.96 |S 43.46 (S 347.68 |S 12.00 |S 96.00
W11-5 Tractor Symble 30"x30" black/yellow 6 S 13.08 |S 78.48 S 22.50 |S 135.00 [$ 15.00 |S 90.00 |S 12.38 |S 7428 S 12.37 |S 7422 |S 43.46 |S 260.76 |S 12.00 |S 72.00
W13-1p 18"x18"Advisory Plaque Black/Yellow 25 S 5.43 [$ 135.75 |$ 9.00 |S 225.00 | S 5.40 |S 135.00 |$ 4.46 |S 111.50 |$ 4.45 (S 111.25 |S 1564 |S 391.00 |$ 6.00 | S 150.00
No Numbers on sign face
W14-2 30"x30 " No Outlet Black/Yellow 15 $ 13.08 |S 196.20 [$ 22.50 (S 337.50 |S 15.00 |$ 225.00 |S 12.38 |S 185.70 [$ 1237 (S 185.55 [$ 43.46 |S 651.90 |S 12.00 |S 180.00
W18-2 Flood Area Ahead 30"x30" black/Yellow 10 S 15.00 |S 150.00 [S 22.50 |S 225.00 |S 15.00 |S 150.00 |S 12.38 |S 123.80 (S 1237 (S 123.70 [S 43.46 |S 434.60 |S 12.00 |S 120.00
W18-3 Do Not Enter When Flooded Black/White 10 $ 15.00 |S 150.00 [$ 18.00 |S 180.00 [$ 15.00 |S 150.00 [$ 12.38 (S 123.80 [$ 12.37|S 123.70 [$ 34.75 (S 347.50 |S 12.00 |S 120.00
18"x18" Blank red 15 $ 7.50 |$ 112.50 |$ 9.00 |S 135.00 |$ 5.40 |S 81.00 |S 4.46 |S 66.90 | S 4.45 | S 66.75 |S 16.15 |S 242.25 |S 6.00 | S 90.00
18"x18" Blank Black/White 10 S 5.43 [$ 54.30 | S 9.00 | S 90.00 |S 5.40 | S 54.00 |S 4.46 |S 44.60 | S 4.45 S 4450 |S 15.64 |S 156.40 | S 6.00 | S 60.00
24"x30" Blank Black/White 15 $ 10.70 |S 160.50 [$ 18.00 |S 270.00 |S 12.00 |S 180.00 |$ 9.90 | S 148.50 | $ 9.90 | S 148.50 [$ 34.75 (S 521.25 S 12.00 |S 180.00
R1-1 30" Stop White/Red 40 S 12.71|S 508.40 |S 19.00 |S 760.00 |S 15.00 |S 600.00 |[S 11.88 |S 475.20 |S 12.37 S 494.80 |S 41.44|S 1,657.60|S 13.00 |S 520.00
R2-1 Speed Limit 24"x30" Black/White 10 $ 10.70 |S 107.00 [$ 18.00 |S 180.00 [$ 12.00 |S 120.00 |$ 9.90 | S 99.00 | S 9.90 | S 99.00 |S 34.75|S 347.50 |S 12.00 |S 120.00
No Numbers on sign face
R3-7L Left Lane Must Turn Left 30"x30" Black/White S 13.08 |S 104.64 S 22.50 |S 180.00 [$ 15.00 |S 120.00 [S 12.38 (S 99.04 |S 12.37|S 98.96 |S 43.46 |S 347.68 |S 12.00 |S 96.00
R3-7R Right Lane Must Turn Right 30"x30" Black/White 6 $ 13.08 |S 78.48 S 22.50 |S 135.00 [$ 15.00 |S 90.00 |S 12.38|S 7428 S 12.37|S 7422 |S 43.46 |S 260.76 |S 12.00 |S 72.00
R12-1 Weight Limit 24"x30" Black/White 10 S 12.45|S 12450 [$ 18.00 |S 180.00 [$ 12.00 |S 120.00 |$ 9.90 |S 99.00 |$ 9.90 | S 99.00 |S 34.75|S 347.50 |S 12.00 |S 120.00
No Numbers on sign face
M1-6 Route Marker blue/yellow 24" 25 $ 16.97 |S 42425 |S 14.00 |$ 350.00 |S 10.40 |$ 260.00 |S 7.95 | S 198.75 |S 16.60 | S 415.00 |S 27.80 [$ 695.00 |S 12.00 |$ 300.00
No Numbers on sign face
M2-1 JCT Black/White 15"x21" 20 5.27 |$ 105.40 6.50 |$ 130.00 |$ 5.26 |S 105.20 |$ 4.32 86.40 | S 9.03 |S 180.60 [$ 15.20 (S 304.00 |S 9.00 |S 180.00
M6-4 Double arrow Blue/Yellow 15"x21" 20 S 6.75 | S 135.00 |$ 6.50 | S 130.00 |$ 5.70 | S 114.00 | S 432 (S 86.40 | S 9.03 [S 180.60 [S 15.20 |S 304.00 | S 9.00 |S 180.00
Metal 0.08 Aluminum
24"x48" 4 holes 8 S 32.82|S 262.56 |S 32.50 |S 260.00 |S 31.20 |S 249.60 |S 25.44 |S 203.52 |S 27.84|S 222.72 |S 38.60 |S 308.80 |S 35.00 |S 280.00
21"x15" 2 holes 40 S 9.14 (S 365.60 | S 9.50 | S 380.00 |S 8.54 S 341.60 |S 6.93 [S 277.20 | S 8.48 | S 339.20 |S 10.55 |S 422.00 |S$ 13.00 [$ 520.00
9"x24" no holes 80 S 6.41 S 512.80 | S 9.00 |S 720.00 |S 5.85[S 468.00 |S 4.77 | S 381.60 | S 5.63 |5 450.40 | S 7.24 |S 579.20 | S 9.00 |S 720.00
9"x30" no holes 30 S 8.02 |$ 240.60 |S 10.00 |S 300.00 |S 7.31 (S 219.30 | S 5.96 |S 178.80 |$ 6.96 | S 208.80 | S 9.05 | S 27150 |S 11.00 |S 330.00




6"x12" 2 holes 60 S 2.29 |$ 137.40 | S 4.00 | S 240.00 |$ 2.00 |S 120.00 | S 1.60 [S 96.00 |$ 2.76 |S 165.60 | S 241 |S 144.60 | S 2.00 |S 120.00
30" Stop 2 holes 40 S 24.41|S 976.40 (S 25.00 |$ 1,000.00 |S 23.90 (S 956.00 [S 19.08 |S 763.20 (S 19.52 |$ 780.80 |$ 30.15 (S 1,206.00 |S 17.00 |S 680.00
18"x24" 2 holes 40 S 1237 |$ 494.80 (S 9.00 [ S 360.00 [S 11.70 |$ 468.00 |S 9.54 (S 381.60 (S 10.44 |S 417.60 [S 14.47 |S 578.80 |$ 9.60 [S 384.00
24"x30" 2 holes 60 S 20.51|$ 1,230.60 |S 14.50 (S 870.00 [S 1950 |$ 1,170.00 |S 15.90 |S 954.00 (S 17.40|S 1,044.00 |S 24.12(S 1,447.20|S 16.00 (S 960.00
30"x30" 4 holes Punched for diamond and Square 80 S 25.64|$ 2,051.20|S 18.00|S 1,440.00|S 24.38(S 1,950.40|S 19.88 S 1,590.40 (S 21.75|$S 1,740.00 [S 30.15|S 2,412.00|$S 20.00 S 1,600.00
18"x18" 4 Holes Punched for diamond and Square 40 S 9.41 |$ 376.40 | S 7.00 |S 280.00 [$ 8.78 | S 351.20 |S 7.16 | S 286.40 | S 8.27 |$ 330.80 [S 10.86 |S 434.40 |S 7.20 |$ 288.00
24" Route Marker M1-6 2 holes 30 S 19.52 |$ 585.60 |S 12.50 (S 375.00 [S 16.20 |$ 486.00 |S 12.72 |S 381.60 (S 11.12|$ 333.60 |S 27.80(S 834.00 [S 18.00 |$ 540.00
Rubber Stacker Stand Dsb100 10 S 13850 |$ 1,385.00 |S 86.87 S 868.70 [S 115.00 |$ 1,150.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 86.87|$ 868.70 [S 80.00 |$ 800.00
36"x36" Roll up Signs Super bright reflective Orange
One Lane Road 10 S 110.50 |$ 1,105.00 |S 66.35 (S 663.50 |S 92.50 (S 925.00 [S 86.55 |$ 865.50 [S 85.57 |$ 855.70 [S 72.73 |$ 72730 |S 65.00 |S 650.00
Fresh Oil 10 S 110.50 |$ 1,105.00 |S 66.35 (S 663.50 |S 92.50 (S 925.00 |S 86.55 |S 865.50 [S 85.57 |$ 855.70 [S 72.73 |S$ 72730 |S 65.00 |S 650.00
Flagger Symble 12 S 110.50 |$ 1,326.00 |S 66.35 (S 796.20 [S 92.50 |$ 1,110.00 |S 86.55 (S 1,038.60 |S 8557 |S 1,026.84 (S 72.73|S 872.76 [S 65.00 |$ 780.00
Road Work Ahead 12 $ 11050 |S 1,326.00 |S 66.35 (S 796.20 [S 9250 |$ 1,110.00 |S 86.55|S 1,038.60 |S 85.57 (S 1,026.84 (S 72.73|S 872.76 |S 65.00 |$ 780.00
Green U Channel Post 10' 2 Ib/ft | 48 S 23.14|$ 1,110.72|S 20.00 (S 960.00 [S 29.25|S 1,404.00 S 22.50(S 1,080.00|$ 29.12 (S 1,397.76 |S 30.20|S 1,449.60 [S 21.00|S 1,008.00
Green U Channel Post 12' 2 Ib/ft | 48 S 2777 |S 1,332.96 (S 22.00(S 1,056.00(|S 35.10(S 1,684.80(S 27.05|S 1,298.40(S 3495|S 1,677.60|S 36.24|S 1,739.52|S 25.00 (S 1,200.00
Orange 28" Double Reflective Collars 4" and 6" 10lb Base | 24 S 2449 |S 587.76 |S 21.43 (S 514.32 [S 24.90 |$ 597.60 [S 28.40 |S 681.60 |S 30.98 [S 743.52 |S 31.05 (S 745.20 |S 24.00 |S 576.00
Wide Body
12"x50 yds Green Electrocut #1177 | 6 roll S 191.22 |$ 1,147.32|S 196.87 |S 1,181.22 |S 168.75|S 1,012.50 [S 157.50 |S 945.00 |S 163.12 |$S 978.72 | quantity not available |$ 216.00 |S 1,296.00
12"x50 yds Black Electrocut #1178 | 4 roll S 191.22 |$ 764.88 |S 196.87 [S 787.48 [S 168.75 | S 675.00 |$ 157.50 [S 630.00 |$ 163.12 (S 652.48 | quantity not available |$ 216.00 |$ 864.00
12"x100 yds Clear Transfer Tape | 6 roll S 115.12 |$ 690.72 |$ 133.31 (S 799.86 [S 60.00 |S 360.00 [S 78.00 |S 468.00 |S 112.50 |S 675.00 |S$ 258.21 (S 1,549.26 |S 142.00 |S 852.00
TPM5 ECF
9"x50 yds White High Intensity #3930 prizmatic | 4 roll S 191.25|$ 765.00 |$ 165.93 [S 663.72 |S 149.63 [S 598.52 [S 136.15 |$ 544.60 (S 153.27 |$ 613.08 |S 246.18 |S 984.72 [S 180.00 |$ 720.00
12"x50 yds White High Intensity #3930 prizmatic | 1roll S 255.00 |$ 255.00 |$ 221.25 (S 221.25 |$ 199.50 [ S 199.50 |$ 181.50 | S 181.50 |$ 204.37 |S 204.37 |S 328.24 (S 328.24 |$ 220.00 |S 220.00
Replacement Pannels Barricade Orange/White
8ft x1"x8" Plastic High Intensity Double Face | 15 S 63.00|S$ 945.00 [S 39.18 |S$ 587.70 [S 46.00 |S 690.00 | NO BID NO BID S 56.62|$ 849.30 [S 53.88|S 808.20 [S 40.00 | S 600.00
Temporary Pavement Tape #3034 | 20 roll S 52.40|$ 1,048.00 |S 619.85|S 12,397.00 |S 47.00 (S 940.00 | NO BID NO BID S 50.58|$ 1,011.60|S 85.88(S 858.80 [S 60.00 |$ 1,200.00
Yellow 4"x50 yds Construction grade
18" Stop/Slow High Intensity Paddles | 10 S 35.00|$ 350.00 |$ 52.78 (S 527.80 [S 53.00 |$ 530.00 [S 50.50 |$ 505.00 (S 28.23 |$ 28230 |S 40.58 (S 405.80 [S 58.00 |$ 580.00
with 6ft Handle
Solar Barricade Flashers Amber | 10 S 41.83|$ 41830 (S 43.53 S 43530 |S 49.50 (S 495.00 |S 52.50 (S 525.00 (S 61.81|$ 618.10 |S 38.41 (S 384.10 |S 49.00 |S 490.00
24" Type 2 Barricades Double Faced High Intensity | 12 S 83.33|$ 999.96 [S 64.96 |S 779.52 [S 79.00 |S 948.00 | NO BID NO BID S 89.16|S 1,069.92|S 65.76 (S 789.12 |$ 100.00 |S 1,200.00
Orange and White Plastic

TOTAL OF

ALL PAGES S 28,183.85 $ 37,081.95 S 26,473.42 $ 19,678.31 $ 24,528.44 $ 35,002.68 S 24,929.60
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